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Social Studies

A Curriculum Companion for Teaching
Environmental Education in Eritrean Elementary Schools
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Deforestation

What is climate?

Deforestation is the cutting down, clearing, burning and removing of trees from
the land. There are many reasons that trees are cleared from the land.

1.

How does the
weather work?

2.

Climate is a big
sort of machine
driven by the sun?
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Climate is a sort of huge ‘machine’. What’s called
‘weather’ is just a small bit of this machine which you
and I notice: you know a storm, a drought, very hot
weather or very cold weather. And I bet you know
what drives this machine, don’t you? Yes, it’s the
sun. Without the sun, there would be no climate, no
weather, no people, no trees, and no life.

3.

1. Sometimes the trees are cut down because people want wood
to build houses or they need wood for cooking.

The climate ‘machine’

2. People cut down the trees so they can build villages and
towns.

it moisture from the sea. As the moist air rises, it

The sun warms the air and hot air rises bringing with
expands. This makes it cooler and so any moisture in the air condenses to make clouds.

3. Trees are sometimes cut down so that people can mine for
gold or tin, iron ore and some other things.
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4.
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And, as you know, clouds mean rain.

5.

Clubs.
Hot air rises to form
clouds.

The sun provides
warms the air.

n developed

Rain helps things to grow.

Clouds mean rain.

The sun also warms the seas and oceans which makes huge currents of water -- a little like winds,
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but inside the ocean. These currents move large amounts of water around the globe. They can
bring warm weather to cold areas and they can bring cold water to warm areas. This can change
the climate of an area.

4. People sometimes want to
look for gas and oil so they
cut down trees.

s a sustainable

All these things -- the oceans, the atmosphere, the hot and the cold parts of the planet, deserts,

5. People need food so they cut down trees to make farms for
cows or to plant crops.

and forests -- all depend upon climate and upon the sun.
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s Greenhouse information cards, 7 cards, A5

s Story - What is climate?

s Plant information cards - A5, 20 cards
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s Deforestation information card: A4, double sided.

s Water cycle picture cards - A4 colour, 5 cards.

s Water cycle definitions: A4

English
A Curriculum Companion for Teaching
Environmental Education in Eritrean Elementary Schools
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s Animal pictures, series 1: A4 size, 20
cards in each set (cat, dog, bird, camel,
goat, cow, horse, hen, fish, lion, monkey,
rabbit, snake, leopard, ostrich, tortoise,
zebra, elephant, hyena, fox).
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h Clubs.
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s Animal pictures, series 2: endangered
and vulnerable, A4 Size, 7 cards in each
set, (African wild ass, Nubian ibex, African
elephant, greater kudu, Soemmerring’s
gazelle, ostrich, leopard).

s Animal pictures – African animals, series
3: A4 size, 16 cards in each set, (rhinoceros,
chameleon, lizard, aardvark, buffalo, eland,
impala, crocodile, Arabian bustard, hedgehog,
hippopotamus, giant golden mole, green
turtle, Egyptian goose, gorilla, dolphin).

Weather cards: A5, 7 cards in
each set, (rain, windy, cloudy,
sunny, hot, cold, storm).

s Animal Food Pictures:
A5 size, 13 cards in each
set, (meat, seeds, mice,
bananas, hay, hen, insects,
lizard, tree, fruit, bird, water,
milk).

Red Sea Zoo
A

B

C

D

E

F

G

9

8

Zoo pictures: 2

7

6

 Web of life cards: A5, 19 cards in each

Seed poem

Here is the Seed

English

set. (hyena, vulture, cheetah, hunting dog, lion,
baboon, giraffe, impala, seeds, wildebeest, tree,
grass, bacteria, dung beetle, fungi, sun, water,
bird, insects).

Here is the seed,
Small and round
Hidden underneath
The ground.
Here is the shoot,
Tiny and small,
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Slowly, slowly
Growing tall.
Here is the sun.
Here is the shower.
Here are the petals.
Here is the flower.

4

3

2

1

s Seed poem - A5

s Zoo picture card - A4 double sided.

s Red Sea Zoo - A4

Science
A Curriculum Companion for Teaching
Environmental Education in Eritrean Elementary Schools
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Don’t
burn your
waste!

An ecosystem is a system in which living
organisms interact with each other and with
the non-living parts of the environment.
Ecosystems and
biodiversity
Biodiversity has been described as the
‘web of life’, ‘the variety of living things’
or ‘the different plants, animals and
micro-organisms, their genes and the
ecosystems of which they are a part’.
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The importance of forests

s a sustainable

Forests and woodlands are rich in
biodiversity. They have many different
types of trees, shrubs, small plants and
grasses. They also contain many animals
such as mammals, insects and birds.

sources
x which
mation cards

Eritrea once had a large variety of plants
and animals, but much of this has been
destroyed through war, drought, human
use, grazing animals, land degradation and
deforestation.

s.

About a century ago, 30% of the landmass
of Eritrea was covered by forest. By 1952,
the amount had decreased to 11%. In
1960, forest cover was estimated to be a
mere 5% of the total area of the country.

Healthy ecosystems contain many
varieties of plants, animals and microorganisms. They are the basis of our
survival because they supply us with
oxygen, clean water, soil and many
other resources.

Currently the percentage of the area
covered by forest is estimated to be as
little as 1% or even less.
(Ministry of Agriculture, Asmara)

Look for ways of producing less
waste.
• Shop more carefully by
choosing products that
have minimal packaging.

The natural forests of Eritrea can be
classified into 6 main categories. They are:
1. Highland forests: these are composed of
a mixture of coniferous species, broadleaved species and other associated
species.
2. Mixed woodlands of acacia and
associated species occurring mainly
in the southern part of the western
lowlands, but also in limited areas
elsewhere in the country.

• Think about how shopping is
brought home e.g. cloth or
woven bag.

3. Bush or shrub
vegetation, this is the
dominant cover in Eritrea.

Reuse

4. Grassland to wooded grassland,
which occurs in many parts of the
country.

Reuse containers, packaging
or waste products. This is so that
the product doesn’t go in the
bin.

5. Riverine forests which is composed
mostly of tamarinds and doum palm,
which are common in the western
lowlands and are frequent in the eastern
lowlands.

Soil structure affects the movement of air, water and plant roots through the soiil.

• Forms a ball

Height: 55cm
Wingspan: 135cm

0-10% clay
0-10% silt
0-10% clay
80-100% sand
0-10% silt

LOAM

ድዱዕ / Cockroach

80-100%
sand
0-10%
clay
0-10% silt
80-100% sand

• Feels soft, smooth and a little bit sticky

7. Swainsons’s Sparrow
(Passer swainsonii)

5. Red-cheeked Cordon-bleu
(Uraeginthus bengalus)

Sandy soils are light and do not hold
water well as have low organic content.

Height: 16cm

4. Blue-breasted bee-eater
(Merops (Variegatus)
lafresnayii)

6. Variable Sunbird
(Cinnyris venustus)

1-15

ies
WASH Activit bs

እግረ-ሽሕ (ዓራዛዝነ)
/ Millipede

Height: 11cm

1-15

Height: 20cm

ቴምቦ / Dragonfly

• Easy to squeeze
1-15

1-15

ሕንዚዝ / Ground beetle

Did you know?

1, 7, 9, 10, 15

10-30% clay
30-50% silt
10-30% clay
25-50% sand
30-50% silt
10-30%
25-50% clay
sand
30-50% silt

Item

Breakdown time

Banana Peel

2 Years

Wool socks

1 to 5 years

Plastic bags

20 to 1000 years

Nylon fabric

30 to 40 years

50-100% clay

Leather

Up to 50 years

0-45% silt
50-100%
clay
0-45% sand

Tin cans

50 years

Glass bottles

1 million years

0-45% silt
0-45%
sand
50-100%
clay

Plastic bottles

1 million years

Timber

1 to 5 years

Paper

up to 6 months

CLAY

25-50% sand

8. Common Bulbul
(Pycnonotus barbatus)

Loam soils are heavier than sandy soils
but also do not hold water well, due to
low organic content.
• Feels extremely sticky and smooth
when moist
• Hard to squeeze

ዕንጭራር / Cricket

Height: 18-21cm

Note: Insects are not to scale
ርግቢት-በረኻ
11. Speckled Pigeon
(Columba guinea)
10. Common Fiscal
(Lanius collaris)

ንህቢ / Honey bee

ጽንብላሊዕ / Butterfly

Height: 23cm

Height: 48cm

• Easily forms a long ribbon more than
5cm long

0-45% silt
0-45% sand

ራዛ
15. Abdmis Stork
(Ciconia abdimii)
Height: 81cm

Clay soils are heavy. Water takes a long
time to infiltrate and tends to run-off.

s Soil Texture Chart A4,

ማይ ደርሆ
13. Egyptian Goose
(Alopochen aegyptiaca)

14. Lesser Black-backed Gull
(Larus fuscus)

Height:73cm

Height: 56cm

s Bird identification
card - A4,

Paper and cardboard
All glass bottles and jars
Aluminum cans and foil
Some plastic bottles

s Insect identification card A4, double sided

Healthy Schools

Compost is nature’s recycling system. The composting process requires 4 main components:
1. organic matter, 2. moisture, 3. oxygen , 4. bacteria

Materials that can and
cannot be composted
YES - food scraps,
animal manure, grass,
branches, ashes,
paper, cardboard

Overview of the Resources

No - plastic,
meat, tins, glass,
stones, bones,
batteries

waste from
kitchen or garden

Composting steps
1.

black soil

air flow

2.

the subject areas of:

waste from
kitchen or garden
black soil

• English

waste from
kitchen or garden

• Science

black soil

• Social Studies

sticks, leaves
twigs

3.

to
A manual has been developed
provide teachers with practical
ideas for extra-curricular activities,
for
including suggested activities
Green Clubs and Health Clubs.

cardboard
base

air flow

& Hygiene
A Manual for Water, Sanitation
and PTA
for Elementary School Directors

The Environmental Education
Curriculum Companions for
practical
elementary schools provide
tal
examples of how Environmen
across
Education can be integrated

outer layer of
leaves or grass

The composting process
Fungi, earthworms, millipedes,
bacteria and other microorganisms break down organic
materials such as leaves,
branches, food scraps and
manure into dark nutrient rich
soil. The compost is very high
in nutrients and beneficial to
the soil. It can help the soil to
hold water and improve plant
growth and health.

ሃመማ / Fly

ኾኽ
12. Fan-tailed Raven
(Corvus thipidurus)

Height: 34cm

Composting

School Clu
in Elementary

ዕኮት / Wasp

9. Baglafecht Weaver
(Ploceus baglafrecht)

1-15

s Reduce, Reuse, Recycle Poster - A2

A manual for

ኣንበጣ / Grasshopper

Height: 13cm

Composting is nature’s own recycling system. It is one of the easiest ways of
turning household and garden waste into something useful and beneficial
to the garden. The process requires little effort and produces nutrient rich soil
relatively quickly and is free!

A Curriculum Companion for Teaching
Environmental Education in Eritrean
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ትዃን / Red cotton bug
ዕንቅርቢት / Scorpion

Height: 23cm

• Forms short ribbons of less than 2cm
long

This table shows the time it
takes for rubbish to
breakdown.

Recycling means that a waste product is returned to a
factory where it is remade into either the same product
or something different. Materials that can be recycled
include:

Science

ጻጸ / Ant

ለኾኽቶ
3. Little Swift (Apus affinis)
Height: 14cm

2. Greater Blue-eared Starling
(Lamprotornis chalybaeus)

Height: 15cm

Recycle

•
•
•
•

SANDY LOAM

ናይ ሓሸራ መለለዪ ካርድ / Insect Identification Cards

Common Birds of Eritrea
ሊሎ
1. Black Kite
(Milvus migrans)

ጣንጡ / Mosquito

• Use small, empty plastic soft drink bottles as drink
bottles for school or outings.

s Ecosystems of Eritrea, poster - A2

SOIL CHARACTERISTIC

• Will not form a ribbon when pressed
between thumb and index finger

• Reuse empty glass jars again
for something else.

6. Mangroves, occurring in many spots
along the coast and concentrated mainly
around the port of Assab and between
Tio and the port of Massawa.

SOIL CLASS

• Feels gritty

Burning waste creates pollution. Burning plastic is very
dangerous as it releases toxic fumes. The alternative is
to bury waste or use the RRR formula:
Reduce - Reuse - Recycle.

Reduce

Each species of plant and animal, no
matter how small, has an important role
to play in a healthy environment.
Eritrea has wide differences in
altitude ranging from sea level, to over
3,000 meters above sea level. These
differences in altitude provides the
country with a variety of climates and
ecosystems, which contain a variety of
plants and animals.

Clubs.

Soil texture chart

Reduce - Reuse
- Recycle

4.

A resource has also been developed
to support the School Directors,
in
School Staff and PTA about ways
ensuring
which they can contribute to
their school operates as a sustainable
school environment.

Elementary School Food

Gardens and Mini-for

ests

Green Club
Manual

Clubs Book
Green Club Manual, Elementary School Food Gardens and Mini-forests
A Manual for WASH Activities in Elementary School Clubs

1. Choose a shady sheltered area

5.

5. Add layer of food scraps, manure etc.

2. Make a frame and lay cardboard on the
bottom of the heap.

6.

6. After each time you add food scraps, add
1-2cm of grass, soil, ash, twigs or leaves.

3. Add a layer 8-12cm high of coarse
materials, e.g. sticks, leaves, twigs.

7.

7. When you are finished layering, cover
with grass or leaves, to stop evaporation.

There are additional resources
provided in the Toolbox which
cards
includes posters, information
and reference materials.

4. Add 1-2 cm of rich soil or compost from a
previous heap and water.

8.

8. Mixing or turning your compost occasionally
(once a month) will speed up the process.
Your compost is ready to put on plants
when it has become rich dark soil.

s Composting: Simple Steps to
Making compost - A2 poster

s Don’t spread germs, wash
your hands! - A2 poster

s Hand washing steps - A2 poster

s Hygiene, sanitation,
water and health
information card - A4,
double sided

Healthy Schools
A Manual for Water, Sanitation &
Hygiene for Elementary School
Directors and PTA

